DOUGLAS COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
"ASPHALT MATERIALS" UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

Solicitation No. 12-001
January 27, 2012 @ 3:00pm

VEN DORS CW MATTHEWS CONTRACTING CQ,, INC CW MATTHEWS CONTRACTING CO., INC CW MATTHEWS CONTRACTING CO., INC
DESCRIPTION PLANT #12 PLANT #16 PLANT #62
"A" BASE OR "B" BINDER - PRICE/TON $46.55 $a7.47 $45.50
2 |B-MOD & E - PRICE/TON $52.11 $53.87 $51.00
3 |F.G.&H. PRICE/TON $56.55 $56.26 $55.50
4 |SANDING MATERIAL - PRICE/TON NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 |CURBING MATERIAL - PRICE/TON NO BID NO BID NO BID

[}
LIMESTONE, 100% ALL PRICES MEET 100% LIMESTONE REQUIREMENT | ALL PRICES MEET 100% LIMESTONE REQUIREMENT ALL PRICES MEET 100% LIMESTONE REQLMREMENT

BLEND MIX ALL PRICES MEET BLEND MIX REQUIREMENT ALL PRICES MEET BLEND MIX REQUIREMENT ALL PRICES MEET BLEND MIX REQUIREMENT

GROUP Il MIX ALL PRICES MEET GROUP il MIX REQUIREMENT ALL PRICES MEET GROUP || MIX REQUIREMENT ALL PRICES MEET GROUP Il MIX REQUIREMENT

SUPER PAVE MIX ALL PRICES MEET SUPER PAVE MIX REQUIREMENT |  ALL PRICES MEET SUPER PAVE MIX REQUIREMENT ALL PRICES MEET SUPER PAVE MIX REGUIREMENT
10 |SUPERPAVE,25MM $46.26 $47.22 $45.25
11 [SUPERPAVE, 19MM $46.55 $47.47 $45.50
12 | SUPERPAVE, 12.5MM $52.11 $53.87 $51.00
13 |SUPERPAVE, TYPE | 9.5MM ¢56.38 ¢55.50 $55.50
14 {SUPERPAVE, TYPEIl, 9.5 MM ss5.55 655,01 $54.50
15 |SUPERPAVE, 4.75MM $56.55 $56.26 $55.50
16 |DELIVERY CHARGES NO BID NO BID NO BID
17 |OTHER CHARGES NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 |PAYMENT TERMS 0% DISCOUNT / NET 30 DAYS 0% DISCOUNT / NET 30 DAYS 0% DISCOUNT / NET 30 DAYS
19 [PLANT LOCATION #12 DOUGLASVILLE, GA #16 VILLA RICA, GA #62 DALLAS, GA
20 |MATERIALS DELIVERY 24 HOURS 24 HOURS 24 HOURS




DOUGLAS COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
"ASPHALT MATERIALS" UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

VENDORS BALDWIN PAVING CO., INC
DESCRIPTION
1 A" BASE OR "B" BINDER - PRICE/TON $45.02
2 |B-MOD & E - PRICE/TON sags8
3 |F.G.&H. PRICE/TON s54.71
4 |SANDING MATERIAL - PRICE/TON NG BID
5 JCURSBING MATERIAL - PRICE/TON NG BID
6 |LIMESTONE, 100% NO BID
7 [BLEND MiIX NO BID
8 [|GROUP Il MIX NO 8ID
9 |SUPER PAVE MIX NO BID
10 |SUPERPAVE 25MM sa2.95
12 |SUPERPAVE, 12.5MM $50.47
13 |SUPERPAVE, TYPE { 9.5MM 455.16
RPAVE, TYPE II, 9.5 MM
14 |SUPE $52.57
15 |SUPERPAVE, 4.75MM $59.20
16 |DELIVERY CHARGES N/A
17 {OTHER CHARGES N/A
18 |[PAYMENT TERMS NET 30
19 [PLANT LOCATION LAFARGE DOUGLASVILLE QUARRY
20 |MATERIALS DELIVERY >4 HOURS




