

DOUGLAS COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
GRAVEL MATERIALS
Invitation to Bid

Bid Opening
December 1, 2017 at 1:00 PM
Solicitation 17-034

Description	Vendor Name- APAC MIDSOUTH AGGREGATES	VULCAN MATERIALS COMPANY
Per net ton in truck		
Rip Rap (pit)	\$34.00	N/A
Type I Rip Rap	\$34.00	\$24.70
Type III Rip Rap	\$34.00	\$24.70
Surge Stone	\$30.00	N/A
Graded Aggregate Base	\$25.50	\$15.70
Commercial GAB	NO BID	N/A
S-3 (#34) Stone	\$29.00	\$20.20
#4 (1" - ½" - ¾")	NO BID	N/A
#5 (1" - ½")	NO BID	\$20.20
#57 (1" #4)	\$28.00	\$20.20
#6 (¾" 3/8")	NO BID	N/A
#67 (¾" 3/8")	\$28.50	N/A
#7 (1/2" #4)	\$33.00	N/A
#8 (Unwashed)	NO BID	N/A

DOUGLAS COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
GRAVEL MATERIALS
Invitation to Bid

Bid Opening
December 1, 2017 at 1:00 PM
Solicitation 17-034

#89 (Unwashed) 3/8" Down	\$34.00	\$24.70
M-10 (#4 Down)	\$27.50	\$21.20
#810	NO BID	N/A
Manufactured Sand	\$29.50	\$21.20
Mixed Stone	NO BID	N/A
Natural Stone	NO BID	N/A
Pond Sand (#50 down)	NO BID	N/A
1/2" Pea Gravel	NO BID	N/A
#4 Pea Gravel	NO BID	N/A
Delivery Charges	NO	NO
Other Charges		
Payment Terms	30 DAYS	NET 15
Plant Location	DALLAS, GA	LITHIA SPRINGS and VILLA RICA
Materials Delivery	2 WEEKS NOTICE (RIP RAP)	UPON REQUEST

DOUGLAS COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
GRAVEL MATERIALS
Invitation to Bid

Bid Opening
December 1, 2017 at 1:00 PM
Solicitation 17-034

Description	Vendor Name- BLUEGRASS MATERIALS	
Per net ton in truck		
Rip Rap (pit)	\$16.75	
Type I Rip Rap	\$24.00	
Type III Rip Rap	\$22.75	
Surge Stone	\$16.75	
Graded Aggregate Base	\$14.50	
Commercial GAB	\$13.25	
S-3 (#34) Stone	\$19.75	
#4 (1" - ½" - ¾")	\$18.25	
#5 (1" - ½")	\$18.75	
#57 (1" #4)	\$19.25	
#6 (¾" 3/8")	\$19.00	
#67 (¾" 3/8")	\$19.00	
#7 (1/2" #4)	\$24.25	
#8 (Unwashed)	\$21.25	

DOUGLAS COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
GRAVEL MATERIALS
Invitation to Bid

Bid Opening
December 1, 2017 at 1:00 PM
Solicitation 17-034

#89 (Unwashed) 3/8" Down	\$21.25	
M-10 (#4 Down)	\$19.25	
#810	\$19.25	
Manufactured Sand	\$26.25	
Mixed Stone	N/A	
Natural Stone	N/A	
Pond Sand (#50 down)	\$4.00	
1/2" Pea Gravel	N/A	
#4 Pea Gravel	N/A	
Delivery Charges	BASED ON LOCATION	
Other Charges		
Payment Terms	25 TH FOLLOWING MONTH	
Plant Location	DOUGLASVILLE, GA	
Materials Delivery	----	

Suzanne Kimberlin-Purchasing Department