

UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION FOR ASPHALT MATERIALS

Solicitation No. 17-035

Bid Opening December 1, 2017 2:00 PM

	VENDORS	BALDWIN PAVING CO., INC	E.R. SNELL CONTRACTOR, INC	C.W. MATTHEWS CONTRACTING CO. INC	C.W. MATTHEWS CONTRACTING CO. INC	C.W. MATTHEWS CONTRACTING CO. INC
	DESCRIPTION					
1	"A" BASE OR "B" BINDER-PRICE /TON	\$44.16	\$41.85	\$42.55	\$53.24	\$52.69
2	B-MOD E (PRICE/TON)	\$46.36	\$43.30	\$45.82	\$55.52	\$55.24
3	F,G,&H (PRICE/TON)	\$48.05	\$45.15	\$47.81	\$57.34	\$57.87
4	SANDING MATERIAL (PRICE/TON)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
5	CURBING MATERIAL (PRICE/TON)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6	LIMESTONE, 100%	ALL MIXES ARE GROUP II	ALL MIXES ARE GROUP II	ALL MIXES ARE GROUP II	ALL MIXES ARE GROUP II	ALL MIXES ARE GROUP II
7	BLEND MIX	ALL MIXES ARE GROUP II	ALL MIXES ARE GROUP II	ALL MIXES ARE GROUP II	ALL MIXES ARE GROUP II	ALL MIXES ARE GROUP II
8	GROUP II MIX	ALL MIXES ARE GROUP II	ALL MIXES ARE GROUP II	ALL MIXES ARE GROUP II	ALL MIXES ARE GROUP II	ALL MIXES ARE GROUP II
9	SUPER PAVE MIX	ALL MIXES ARE GDOT APPROVED SUPERPAVE	ALL MIXES ARE GDOT APPROVED SUPERPAVE	ALL MIXES ARE GDOT APPROVED SUPERPAVE	ALL MIXES ARE GDOT APPROVED SUPERPAVE	ALL MIXES ARE GDOT APPROVED SUPERPAVE
10	SUPERPAVE, 25 MM	\$43.13	\$41.60	\$42.11	\$52.95	\$52.13
11	SUPERPAVE, 19 MM	\$44.27	\$42.35	\$42.99	\$53.53	\$53.25
12	SUPERPAVE, 12.5 MM	\$46.68	\$43.30	\$45.82	\$55.52	\$55.24
13	SUPERPAVE, TYPE I, 9.5 MM	\$48.05	\$45.15	\$47.76	\$57.48	\$57.93

14	SUPERPAVE, TYPE II 9.5 MM	\$46.77	\$45.15	\$46.70	\$56.47	\$57.13
15	SUPERPAVE, 4.75 MM	\$50.18	\$47.65	\$48.97	\$58.06	\$58.54
16	OPEN GRADED INTERLAYER (OGI)	\$60.49	\$52.70	\$53.99	\$64.17	\$60.81
17	DELIVERY CHARGES	NO	NO	NO	N/A	NO
18	OTHER CHARGES	NO	NO	NO	N/A	NO
19	PAYMENT TERMS	NET 30	NET 30	NET 30	NET 30	NET 30
20	PLANT LOCATION	DOUGLASVILLE, GA	LITHIA SPRINGS, GA	DOUGLASVILLE, GA	VILLA RICA, GA	DALLAS, GA
21	MATERIALS DELIVERY	24 HOURS	24 HOURS	24 HOURS	24 HOURS	24 HOURS

Suzanne Kimberlin
 Purchasing Department