

UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION FOR ASPHALT MATERIALS

Solicitation No. 18-020

Bid Opening November 30, 2018 2:00 PM

	VENDORS	Baldwin Paving Co.	E.R. Snell Contractor, Inc	C.W. Matthews Contracting Co., Inc	C.W. Matthews Contracting Co., Inc	C.W. Matthews Contracting Co., Inc
	DESCRIPTION					
1	"A" BASE OR "B" BINDER-PRICE /TON	50.01	55.65	48.96	59.68	59.33
2	B-MOD E (PRICE/TON)	54.23	59.00	53.80	62.90	62.84
3	F,G,&H (PRICE/TON)	55.77	61.55	56.22	65.60	66.50
4	SANDING MATERIAL (PRICE/TON)	NO BID	63.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
5	CURBING MATERIAL (PRICE/TON)	NO BID	63.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6	LIMESTONE, 100%	All Mixes are Group II	All Mixes are Group II	All Mixes are Group II	All Mixes are Group II	All Mixes are Group II
7	BLEND MIX	All Mixes are Group II	All Mixes are Group II	All Mixes are Group II	All Mixes are Group II	All Mixes are Group II
8	GROUP II MIX	All Mixes are Group II	All Mixes are Group II	All Mixes are Group II	All Mixes are Group II	All Mixes are Group II
9	SUPER PAVE MIX	All Mixes are GDOT Approved Superpave	All Mixes are GDOT Approved Superpave	All Mixes are GDOT Approved Superpave	All Mixes are GDOT Approved Superpave	All Mixes are GDOT Approved Superpave
10	SUPERPAVE, 25 MM	49.20	52.45	48.40	59.21	58.54
11	SUPERPAVE, 19 MM	50.01	55.65	49.51	60.14	60.12
12	SUPERPAVE, 12.5 MM	54.23	59.00	53.80	62.90	62.84
13	SUPERPAVE, TYPE I, 9.5 MM	57.13	61.55	56.06	65.79	66.58

14	SUPERPAVE, TYPE II 9.5 MM	55.77	60.65	54.48	64.35	65.43
15	SUPERPAVE, 4.75 MM	58.05	63.75	58.11	66.65	67.49
16	OPEN GRADED INTERLAYER (OGI)	62.42	68.05	65.55	73.03	70.25
17	DELIVERY CHARGES	No	No	N/A	N/A	N/A
18	OTHER CHARGES	No	No	N/A	N/A	N/A
19	PAYMENT TERMS	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30
20	PLANT LOCATION	Douglasville	Lithia Springs	#12 Douglasville	#16 Villa Rica	#62 Paulding
21	MATERIALS DELIVERY	12 Hours	24 Hours	24 Hours	24 Hours	24 Hours

Suzanne Kimberlin  
 Purchasing Department